
R E V I E W S 
Les Rose's 

Gas 

A calculator embedded in its belly, a 
dead stuffed beaver ornaments an exe­
cutive desk in Gas. Intended as a joke, 
the shot lasts for only a few brief sec­
onds, but it unwittingly provides a most 
telling image. If Gas is an example of a 
Canadian movie, the beaver probably 
died of embarrassment when he read 
the scriptJSiven the crass intentions of, 
the filmmakers (who, as the movie 
proves, are obviously not as easily 
embarrassed) they would use his corpse 
in such a "practical manner - anything 
for a laugh. The juxtaposition of the 
two - our national symbol and the ins­
trument of commerce - makes a perfect 
comment on this sorry product from our 
film industry. And just as this shot 
misfires as a joke when examined, so 
does Gas. To call it a travesty of comedy 
would be a compliment. Despite all 
efforts (and some strove mightily, espe­
cially the stunt drivers and special 
effects people). Gas is painful, a mess 
of miscalculations about the nature 
of mayhem comedy. 

The central story-line in Gas concerns 
the stockpiling of gasoline by the mega­
lomaniac oil tycoon Duke Stuyvesant 
(Sterling Hayden), who looks like a Holly­
wood version of Howard Hughes and 
acts toward his inane sons. Earl and 
Baron (Dustin VValn and Vlasta Vrana), 
like Pp Cartwright gorte berserk. His 
actions create an artificial fuel shortage 
and endless lineups at his station, which 
is manned by Ira (Keith Knight in one of 
the better performances in the movie). 
Waiting in the crowd is Matt Lloyd, a 
salesman and one half of the sex-not-
love-interest (a very innocuous Howie 
Mandel). On the fringes are those on the 
make : Rhonda, a hooker in a bordello-
van (Helen Shaver in a role that wastes 
her talents); Jane Beardsley, a hard, 
ambitious TV interviewer looking for 
the big story (Susan Anspach); and a. 
somewhat aimless, perhaps brainless, 
photojournalist who is the other half of 
the sex interest, Sarah Marshall (Sandee 
Currie). Overhead in the WGAZ heli­
copter commenting on the scene is the 
Noz, the local rock DJldonald Suther­
land, of whom it must be said that he 
doesn't walk, but sits through his part). 

The main plot becomes complicated 
by the avarice of the silly nephews of the 
local Godfather, Leo Vespucci (Vincent 
Marino, nodding his head menacingly 
while wearing the requisite white suit 
and travelling in the usual black limou­
sine). A pair of US Array motor pool MPs 
(Alf Humphries and Philip Akin), running 
their own scam, also become involved. 
The boy-meets-girl plot is complicated 
by Sarah's over-protective brother, Ed 
(Peter Aykroyd). But Ed isn't protecting 
his sister's honour; he's lusting after 
her himself, thus introducing the ugly, 
distasteful theme of incest. His destruc­
tive kung-fu mentality may be respon­
sible for the big set scenes in Gas - the 
demolition of the restaurant, the explo­
sion at the gas station and the specta­
cular climax of the car chase - yet his 
motivation is sick. Ed is mentally ill, not 
amusing. 
Through Ed, however, comes some 

understanding of why Gas fails as a 
comedy, for his role makes it the most 
obvious that the movie is influenced by 
earlier models. That the similarities are 

supposed to be noticed is stressed by an 
incident near the end, of a crew filming 
a James Cagney gangster scene. The 
scene echoes its various predecessors 
suggesting that films are made and then 
re-made - memories of the past enrich­
ing the present. Thus Ed's kUng-fu tactics 
are ^reminders of Peter Sellers in the 
Pink Panther series. Moreover, Ed imi­
tates Groucho Marx outright in the res­
taurant scene. A Lone Ranger (in black 
not white), driven by Tonto, takes his gas 
at gun-point. The Noz, while a pale 
creature, functions like the Wolfman of 
American Grafitti. Surely those dozens 
of firemen rescuing fat ladies from the 
spa are descendants of the Keystone 
Cops. Behind the Duke's sons, about to 
weld a gasoline storage tank with a 
blowtorch, or the Mafia nephews, deal­
ing with broken waterpipes, lurk the 
quarrelsome comedy teams of Martin 
and Lewis, Abbott and Costello, and 
Laurel and Hardy, all inept and con­
stantly on the verge of being blown to 
bits or washed away. What Gas could 
have been is a celebration of its ante­
cedents. But it is not, 

Essentially, Gas misuses its comic 
material, when Ed descends to slobber­
ing over his sister, he can no longer 
effectively play his part as the wrong-
headed guardian of family virtue who 
sets off devastating chain reactions for 
what are seen as the right reasons. Quite 
noticeably too. Gas, like the Marx broth­
ers' moviSfe, is conceived around "big" 
scenes of controlled mayhem. But unlike 
its ancestors. Gas does not entertain as it 
builds up to them. Groucho gets off one 
good line after another; Gas contains 
nary a single, solitary memorable line. 
The pairs here are ineffectual for similar 
reasons; they don't engage in comic 
banter, usually based on semantic mis­
understanding, but simply make a lot of 
tedious noise. Futhermore, since each 
one is almost indistinguishable from his 
mate (even physically), the smart-stupid 
reverses that form the foundation for 
the comedy of the earlier teams cannot 
even exist. Imitation, as well as being 
the sincerest form of flattery, is also a 
dangerous game to play. By inviting 
comparison. Gas shows how far short of 
its model it falls. 

Finally, comedy usually, almost for­
mally, metes out justice in the end. The 
vicious, in this case the avaricious and 
corrupt, should stand revealed, stripped 

of their pretensions and humbled, at 
least for the present. But in Gas, with 
Duke believing the fuel seeped into the 
ground and the others just standing 
around, none of the lines of the plot are 
tied off. The unresolved problems pre­
sumably just evaporate - like gas. The 
only good jokes in this movie are on its 
title. 
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Ron Mann's 

Imagine the Sound 

.3 Imagine the Sound is less a film, than it 
U is _ an art exposition brought to the 

screen. Music is the art form portrayed ; 
more specifically, the music of jazz 
musicians Cecil Taylor, Bill Dixon, Archie 
Shepp and Paul Bley. 

To best understand the music which 
they create and perform in the film, it is 
important to consider the historical 
context from which their sound has 
emerged. The reaction against the con­
fines of late-forties/early-fifties jazz 
music ('Bebop') and the Cool Jazz' of the 
late fifties and early sixties, spawned a 
new breed of musician which sought 
the purity of sound itself. 

The unspoken hope of every artist is 
that his work imitates, and thereby 
becomes life Cecil Taylor expresses this 
desire in the opening sequence of the 
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